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Abhik Kundu <kundu.abhik@gmail.com>

Grant in Aid
1 message

PAO DOS <pr.aospace@isro.gov.in> Tue, Oct 11, 2022 at 2:45 PM
To: kundu.abhik@gmail.com
Cc: M A Paul <respond@isro.gov.in>

Sir/Madam

With reference to the Department's Sanction no:DS_2B-13012(2)/22/2019-Sec.II dated 19/09/2022 and this office has released the grant vide PAO
Reference No: CP00000146 dated 10/10/2022 as mentioned below:

Name of the Project
Amount Sanctioned (as per
Latest Sanction)
(Amount in Rs.)

Adjustment of
Interest
(Amount in Rs.)

Net amount
Released
(Amount in
Rs.)

Date of
Transaction

"Elucidation of the deformation signatures and fluvial activity near
junction of Noachis Terra with Margaritifier and Arabia Terra..". 4,83,520/- -NIL- 4,83,520/- 11.10.2022

It is requested to acknowledge the receipt of the above mentioned grant immediately

Regards,

Sreerama Murty L
Pay & Accounts Officer, Department of Space,
Antariksh Bhawan, New BEL Road,
Bengaluru-560094
Tel. No. 080-22172253/2042/2059/2255/2256/2038
Mob. No. 9177409644

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail message, including any attachments,
is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain
confidential and privileged information. Any unauthorized review, use,
disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended
recipient, please contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all
copies of the original message.



FORM OF FUND UTILISATION CERTIFICATE 

(PROJECTS / SCHEMES) 

Name of the Nodal Institution: Asutosh College (Calcutta University). 

Department of Organisation: Department of Geology. 

Name of the Project Scheme : Chandrayaan-2 Science Plan project entitled "Terrain Mapping 
Camera (TMC) data utilization for understanding Lunar surface processes". 

-Certified that a sum of Rs. 6,97.761/- only of Grant-in-aid released during the fiñancial 

year 2022-2023, in favour of Asutosh College (Kolkata) on the subject project (original 
project sanction number: WP/PSD/2019/Ch-2/TMC-2/AC-01; Date 1 1/10/2019) for the third 

(First-4Seeend-+Third) year by Space Applications Centre, Department of Space, Goverinent 
of India and Rs. 35,639/- unspent balanc� of the second year of the same project was 

available for the third year of the project. 

A sum of Rupees 7,36,550/- has been spent during the financial year 2022-2023 (third and 
final year of the project) on the Project / Schem�. Therefore, the sum of 7,33,400/- (i.e. 
Grant-in-aid of Rs. 6,97,761/- + Unspent balance of previous year Rs. 35,639/-) has been 
fully utilized in the said period. 

Project Investigator 

Rupees 3150/- (extra expenditure) is not being claimed. 

Head of nstitution 

(with seal) 
PRINCIPAL 

ASUTOSH COLLEGE 
92, S. P. MUKHERJEE ROAD 

KOLKATA-700 026 

Registrar 
Finance Officer 

(with seal) 
BURSAR 

For Beriwal & Associatcg 
CharteIed Accountants 

GAuditox riwal 
Mewith seal)" 

ASUTOSH COLLEGE 
92, S. P, MUKHERJEE ROAD 

KOLKATA-700 026 

035302 



1. Name & Address of the tnstitution: Asutosh College, 92 SP Mukherjee Road, Bhawanipore, Kolkata-700026 
2. Project title: Teain Mapping Camera (TMO) data utilization for understanding Lunar surface processes. 

3. Name of the PI & Designation : Dr. Abhik Kundu, Associate Professor 
4. Nameof the Scheme: Chandrayaan 2 Science Plan 

5.Whether Recurring or Non Recurring grants: Recurring 
6. Grants position at the beginning of the Financial year 

1 

Unspent 
Balances of 

grants received 

years [Figure as 
at Sl. no 6 (ii)) 

35, 639 

UTILUSATION CERTIFICATE FOR THE YEAR 2022-2023 in respect of 
GRANTS IN AID Released by Department of Space 

() Cash in Hand/Bank : Rs, 35, 639/ 

7. Details of grants received, expenditure incurred and closing balances: (Actuals). 

(i) Unadjusted advances :..... 

(iüi) Total : Rs. 35, 639/ 

Interest 

Earned 

thereon 

Nil (Current 
Account) 

(i) 

(iv) 

Interest 

deposited back 

FORM OF UTILISATION CERTIFICATE 
FOR GRANTEE ORGNISATION 

to the 

Government 

3 

Nil 

Details of Grants position at the end of the year 
(i) Cash in Hand/Bank : Rs. -3,150/ 
(ü) Unadjusted Advances ...Nil... 

GHR 12 -A 
(See Rute 238(1) 

Sanction 

No. (i) 

Grant received during the year 

WP/PSD201 
9/Ch-2/TMC 

2/AC-01 

(Original 
Project 

Sanction) 

4 

O/o Pr.AO 
Ref No: (i) 

Date Amount 

(i) Total:Rs. -3,150/-(Not being claimed). Therefore effective closing balance : Nil 

* (ii) (iv) 

Total 

available 

Fund 

(1+2-3+4(i)] 

5 

7,33,400 

Expenditure 
incurrerd 

6 

7,36,550 

(Amount in Rs.) 

Closing 
Balances 

(5-6) 

7 

Certified that I have satisfied myself that the conditions on which grants were sanctioned have been duly fulfilled/are being fulfilled and that 
Ihave exercised following checks to see that the money has been actually utilized for the purpose for which it was sanctioned: 

-3,150 

The main accounts and the other subsidiary accounts and registers (including assets registers) are maintained as 
prescribed in the relevant Act/Rules/Standing instructions (mention the Act/Rules) and have been duly audited by 
designated auditors. The figures depicted above tally with the audited figures mentioned in financial 
statements/accounts. 
There exist internal controls for safeguarding public funds/assets, watching outcomes and achievements of physical 
targets against the financial inputs, ensuring quality in asset creation etc. & the periodic'evaluation of internal controls is 
exercised to ensure their effectiveness. 

1o the best of our knowledge and belief, no transactions have been entered that are in violation of relevant 
Act/Rules/Standing instructions and scheme guidelines. 
The responsibilities among the key functionaries for execution of the scheme have been assigned in clear terms and are not 
general in nature. 

1/10/2019| 6,97,761 



Date... 

(v) 

Narne 

Signature 

(vi) It has been ensured that the physical and financial pertomnance under the scheme PESPOND (name of the 
Scheme) has been according to the requirements, as prescribed in the guidelines issued by Govt. of India and the 
performance /targets achieved statement for the year to which the utilzation of the fund resulted in outeomes given at 
Reports submitted to the Programme Office. 

(vi) 

(vili) 

(ix) 

The expenditure on various components of the scheme was in proportions authorized as per the scheme guidelines and 
terms and conditions of the grants in aid. 

The utilization of the fund resulted in outcomes given at Reports duly forwarded to respective programme Office (to be 
formulated by the Department concerned as per their requirements/specifications). 
Details of various schemes executed by the agency through grantsinaid received from the same Ministey or from other 

Ministries is enclosed at Annexure 

Place :.KoL KA TA 

It is certified that for the same purpose we have not received any grant from the other Ministry/Department or any other 
Private Body 

bas 
ChiefFinance Officer (ead df the Finance)Seal 

BURSAR 
ASUTOSH COLLEGE 

92, S. P. MUKHERJEE ROAD 
KOLKATA-700 026 

Signature 

Name .. Manas Kabi 

Head of the Oranisation 
Seal PRINCIPAL 

ÅSUTOSH COLLEGE 
92, S. P. MUKHERJEE ROAD 

KOLKATA-700 026 

Note: Any interest earned on unutilized funds during previous year and not remitted back to Govt. should be included in the opening 
balance at Sl. No. 6 (i) 
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Arpita Mandal <arpitamandal.micro@gmail.com>

SERB-Notification
1 message

SERB_Administrator@serbonline.in <SERB_Administrator@serbonline.in> Tue, Oct 18, 2022 at 11:32
AM

To: serbinfo1@gmail.com

Science and Engineering Research Board
(Statutory Body Established Through an Act of Parliament : SERB Act 2008)

Department of Science and Technology, Government of India

FILE NO. SRG/2020/000873

SCIENCE & ENGINEERING RESEARCH BOARD(SERB)

(a statutory body of the Department of Science & Technology, government of India)

Science and Engineering Research Board
3rd & 4th Floor, Block II

Technology Bhavan, New Mehrauli Road
New Delhi - 110016

Dated: 11-Oct-2022

ORDER

Subject: Research project entitled “Waste to Value Added Fertilizer: An alternative disposal strategy of
Chicken Feathers and Poultry litter” under the guidance of Dr. Arpita Mandal, Microbiology, Asutosh College ,
92, Shyamaprasad Mukherjee Road. Kolkata. West Bengal. India. PIN - 700 026,WEST BENGAL-700026.

1.  This is in continuation of SERB's sanction order No. "SRG/2020/000873" dated "09 December, 2020 "
of Science and Engineering Research Board (SERB).

2.  Sanction of the competent authority is hereby accorded to the payment of a sum of   Rs. 400000/- (Rupees
Four Lakh only) under 'Grants-in-aid General' to Vice Principal, Asutosh College, 92, Shyamaprasad
Mukherjee Road. Kolkata. West Bengal. India. PIN - 700 026 Under Grant-in-aid General being the 2nd grant
for the financial year 2022-2023 for implementation of the above said project.

3.  Sanction of the competent authority is also accorded to  the carry forward of unspent balance of  Rs. 1926/-
(Rupees One Thousand Nine Hundred and Twenty Six only) ( Recurring Rs. 1707 and Non-Recurring Rs. 219 )
to Asutosh College, 92, Shyamaprasad Mukherjee Road. Kolkata. West Bengal. India. PIN - 700 026 from  FY
2021-2022 to FY 2022-2023 for the same purpose for which it was sanctioned.

.

4.  Sanction of the grant is subject to the conditions as detailed in Terms & Conditions available at the website
(www.serb.gov.in).

5. It is certified that provision of GFR 212 relating to Utilization Certificates (Ucs) for the funds released under the
grant have been satisfied and the UC/s is/are enclosed herewith. 

6. The expenditure involved is debitable to  Fund for Science & Engineering Research (FSER) 

http://www.serb.gov.in/
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This release is being made under Start-up Research Grant. (EC Life Sciences)  (SC).

7. The Sanction has been issued to Asutosh College, 92, Shyamaprasad Mukherjee Road. Kolkata. West
Bengal. India. PIN - 700 026 with the approval of the competent authority under delegated powers on 10
October, 2022 and vide Diary No. SERB/F/5690/2022-2023 dated 11 October, 2022

8. The release amount of Rs. 400000/- (Rupees Four Lakh only) ( Recurring Rs. 400000 and Non-Recurring Rs.
0 ) will be drawn by the Under Secretary of the SERB and will be disbursed by means of RTGS transaction as
per their Bank details given below:

PFMS Unique
Code asutoshcollege

Account Name ASUTOSH COLLEGE SERB
Account Number 00350100007887
Bank Name &
Branch

 BANK OF BARODA BHAWANIPUR BRANCH,29, S.P.MUKHERJEE
ROAD,CALCUTTA,700025, West Bengal

IFSC/RTGS Code BARB0BHOWAN
Email id of A/C
Holder mail@asutoshcollege.in

Email id of PI arpitamandal.micro@gmail.com

9. The institute will maintain separate audited accounts for the project. A part or whole of the grant must be kept
in an interest earning bank account which is to be reported to SERB. The interest thus earned will be treated as
credit to the institute to be adjusted towards further installment of the grant.

10. As per rule 211 of GFR the accounts of Grantee Institution shall be open to inspection by the sanctioning
authority / audit whenever the institute is called upon to do so.

11. The institute will furnish to the SERB, Utilization certificate(separate for Recurring & Non-Recurring ) and an
audited statement of accounts pertaining to the grant immediately after the end of each financial year.

12. After completion of the project unspent balance if any should be returned as Demand Draft drawn in favour of
"Fund for Science and Engineering Research" payable at New Delhi.

13. The organization/institute/university should ensure that the technical support/financial assistance provided to
them by the Science & Engineering Research Board, a statutory body of the Department of Science &
Technology (DST), Government of India should invariably be highlighted/ acknowledged in their media releases
as well as in bold letters in the opening paragraphs of their Annual Report.

14. In addition, the investigator/host institute must also acknowledge the support provided to them in all
publications, patents and any other output emanating out of the project/program funded by the Science &
Engineering Research Board, a statutory body of Department of Science & Technology (DST), Government of
India.

(Dr. Pramod Kumar Prasad)

Scientist-D

https://www.google.com/maps/search/29,+S.P.MUKHERJEE+ROAD,CALCUTTA,700025,+West+Bengal?entry=gmail&source=g
mailto:mail@asutoshcollege.in
mailto:arpitamandal.micro@gmail.com
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pk.prasad@serb.gov.in

To,

Under Secretary

SERB, New Delhi

Copy forwarded for information and necessary action to: -

1. The Principal Director of Audit, A.G.C.R.Building, IIIrd Floor I.P. Estate, Delhi-110002

2. Sanction Folder, SERB , New Delhi.

3. File Copy

4.                        Dr. Arpita Mandal
Microbiology
Asutosh College , 92, Shyamaprasad Mukherjee Road. Kolkata. West Bengal. India. PIN -
700 026,WEST BENGAL-700026
Email: arpitamandal.micro@gmail.com
Mobile: 918900356710

5. Vice Principal,
Asutosh College, 92, Shyamaprasad Mukherjee Road. Kolkata. West Bengal. India. PIN -
700 026

(Dr. Pramod Kumar Prasad)

Scientist-D

pk.prasad@serb.gov.in

************************ LEGAL DISCLAIMER *************************

Please do not reply to this mail !!

[ SERB is now on Social-Media. Kindly follow us on Twitter: @serbonline https://www.twitter.com/serbonline]

https://www.twitter.com/serbonline
mailto:pk.prasad@serb.gov.in
mailto:arpitamandal.micro@gmail.com
mailto:pk.prasad@serb.gov.in
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This is a system generated information and does not require any signature.This E-Mail may contain Confidential
and/or legally privileged Information and is meant for the intendedrecipient(s) only. If you have received this e-mail in
error and are not the intended recipient/s, kindly notify us at info@serbonline.in and then delete this e-mail
immediately from your system. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure, dissemination, forwarding, printing or
copying of this email or any action taken in reliance on this e-mail is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. Internet
communications cannot be guaranteed to be timely,secure, error or virus-free. The sender does not accept any
liability for any errors, omissions, viruses or computer problems experienced by any recipient as a result of this e-mail.

*******************************************************************
'SAVE PAPER - THINK BEFORE YOU PRINT!'

* Donï¿½t want to receive such notification anymore?Click here to send a mail to unsubscribe

mailto:info@serbonline.in
mailto:info@serbonline.in?subject=Unsubscribe
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PARDICOLOR Creative Arts Fund’s parent organisation is Wildlife Asia Limited.  

ABN: 32 143 935 769 

 

Arts Grant Agreement : Dr Arijit Chatterjee 

Project: Coexistence and Conservation: A forgotten tradition between humans and wildlife 

Timeline: December 2022 - July 2023 

Funding: $ 500 USD  

 

This Grant Agreement contains the terms and conditions of PARDICOLOR Creative Art Fund’s 

(“PARDICOLOR”) (On behalf of Wildlife Asia) USD $ 500 grant (“the Grant”) to Dr Arijit Chatterjee (“the 

Grantee”) of 1/8A/1 Netaji Nagar Kolkata 700092, India (Grantee Address). 

 

 

PARDICOLOR agrees to make available USD $500 to Dr Arijit Chatterjee to complete the proposed   

‘Coexistence and Conservation: A forgotten tradition between humans and wildlife’ project (“the 

Project”) this will entail the following actions;  

 

The aims of the Project funded by the Grant are to:  

a) Produce an anthology illustration series of 10-12 illustrations detailing different incidences of 

human-wildlife interactions, organise an exhibit of the work, produce and publish a poster for 

distribution to local schools, colleges and NGOs, and online distribution via social media. 

 

GRANT AGREEMENT 

 

1. The Grantee agrees to use the Grant exclusively for the Project described in the Grant 

Agreement and as agreed on correspondence with PARDICOLOR.  

 

2. The Grantee confirms that the collaboration and any agreements made with other artists are 

genuine and takes responsibility for communicating with PARDICOLOR on all parties’ (the 

Grantee’s and the collaborators’) behalf.  

             

 

 

 

 

 
Signed:……………………………………  Grantee 
Date: 18.01.2023 
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3. The Grantee must get written permission from PARDICOLOR before making any changes to 

the Project or to its aims, structure, delivery, outcomes, duration or ownership. If PARDICOLOR 

agrees that Grantee can make changes to the Project, we may ask you to agree to additional 

conditions and sign an updated Grant Agreement.  

 

4. The Grantee agrees to start the Project within INSERT of receiving the first grant payment from 

PARDICOLOR.  

 

5. The Grantee agrees to carry out the Project with reasonable care, thoroughness, competence 

and to a standard that would be expected for your level of experience in your artistic practice, 

and in a manner that is safe to the Grantee and project partners. PARDICOLOR accepts no 

liability or responsibility should the Grantee engage in any activities that cause them or project 

partners harm during the project period.  

 

6. The Grantee agrees to respond to any requests for information about the project, provide 

regular updates as well as a short artistic or narrative report on the completion of the works 

(including photographs where available) to PARDICOLOR, no later than three months after the 

Project end date.  

 

7. The Grantee agrees to satisfactorily account for how the Grant funding is spent no later than 

three months after the Project end date.  

 

8. The Grantee agrees to retain original materials and documentation (photographs and video) 

the Project, to be published on the PARDICOLOR website and social media platforms including 

those of affiliates (Wildlife Asia). Original artworks shall remain the property of the Grantee.   

 

9. If the Grantee enters into an agreement with any third party with a view to commercial 

exploitation of the Project or anything related to it, the Grantee must contact PARDICOLOR to 

obtain written consent. Consent may be subject to conditions, including conditions requiring the 

repayment of all or part of the grant. 

 

10. Both parties acknowledge that 75% of the grant will be disbursed at the beginning of the project, 

and the remaining 25%will be disbursed upon completion of the project. 
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Grant Agreement signatories:  

 

 

 

 

   ………………………………………….. 

Clare Campbell       (Name)  Arijit Chatterjee 

Executive Director, Wildlife Asia    Artist 

Date:  25 November 2022    Date: 18.01.2023    

 







PROF. SUMIT HOMEHCUAHDURI DR. J.R.B ALFRED

THE ZOOLOGICAL SOCIETY KOLKATA
CERTIFICATE OF INTERNSHIP

IS PRESENTED TO

For completing 6 months ZSK-India National Internship Programme, 2022

Conducted From 1st September, 2022 - 28th February, 2023

Ms. Sreya Sarkar

Hony. general secretary President
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